NATIONAL FOOD AUTHORITY

Cagayan Valley Regional Office

©OProvincial Highway. Barengay Mabinl, Sautiapo Gty. Isalmla 3311 wwElon by o
LIST OF AWARDED PROJECTS
September 1 to December 31, 2022
APPROVED BUDGET DATE OF
NAME OF PROJECT [;“%T FOR THE CONTRACT PARTICIPATING BIDDERS AMOU‘?;‘)OF BID WINNING BIDDER ngzgs;h:gﬁT DATE OF PRE BID SUBMISSION & DATE OF AWARD
: ® OPENING OF BIDS
1. Filzack Industries Packaging Corporation " . . 3 . 3
PROCUREMENT OF BRAND NEW 50-KG 1 8,823,200.00 2. Golden Portals Industries, I 7,945,800.00 Filzack Industries Packaging Corporation June 9, 2022 June 20, 2022 June 30, 2022 July 7, 2022
CAPACITY RICEAND PALAY MTS REQUIREMENT S0 Ge TS MO TS ’
FOR JUNE TO DECEMBER 2022 2 15,237,500.00 L. Filzack Industries Packaging Corporation 13,662,000.00 Golden Portals Industries, Inc. June 9, 2022 June 20, 2022 June 30,2022 July 7, 2022
2. Golden Portals Industries, Inc.
ciiﬁ?fg:;f:vl-ifz'{)gg:s%ﬁf;&?sz& 1 1,284,560.00 New Amson Construction 1,048,587.95 New Amson Construction August 9, 2022 August 17,2022 August 30, 2022 September 6, 2022
STRUCTURES OF ISABELA BRANCH FOR 2ND
SEM 2 1,000,000.00 RTC Construction and Supply 766,241.44 RTC Construction and Supply August 9, 2022 August 17, 2022 August 30, 2022 September 6, 2022
SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF 2ND PRIVATE MILLING 1 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
SERVICES REQUIREMENT OF NFACVRFORCY | 2 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
2022 3 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
4 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
5 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
6 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
7 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
8 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
9 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
10 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
11 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
12 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing October 13, 2022 October 25,2022 |  November 2, 2022 November 8, 2022
13 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
14 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
15 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
16 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
17 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
18 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
19 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
20 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
21 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
22 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
23 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
24 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
25 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
26 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
27 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing No Bid Submitted
28 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
29 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
30 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
31 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
32 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
33 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Gra?ns Process%ng Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grafns Processing Center October 13, 2022 October 25, 2022 November 2, 2022 November 8, 2022
34 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
35 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
36 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
37 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
38 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
39 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
40 1,195,631.40 Goldr?ch R%cemlll & Marketing No Bid Submitted
41 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
42 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
43 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
44 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
45 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
46 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
47 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
48 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
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49 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. October 13,2022 October 25,2022 | N 2,2022 ber 8, 2022
50 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
51 1,195,631.40 NMIAC 1,195,631.40 NMIAC
52 1,195,631.40 NMIAC 1,195,631.40 NMIAC
53 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemill 965,961.25 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemill
54 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemill
S5 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemill Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
56 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemiil
587 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center
58 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center 1,195631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center October 13,2022 October 25,2022 November 2, 2022 November 8, 2022
59 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center
60 1.195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
M Good Samaritan MPC 1,195,631.40 I Good Samaritan MPC ]| _October13,2022 | October25,2022 | Novemher2,2022 | November8, 2022
61 1,195,631.40 R&A Grains & Milling Center Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
’ Good Samaritan MPC Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
62 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
63 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,150,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
64 1,195,631.40 Eastern Graln Center, inc. 1,150,000,00 Eastern Graln Center, Inc. October13,2022 | October25,2022 | NovemberZ,2022 | November§, 2022
Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,125,000.00 Eastern Grain Center, Inc.
65 119563140 Pan Ricemill No Bid Submitted
66 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,125,000.00 ] Eastern Grain Center, Inc. | October3,2022 { October25,2022 | November2 2022 | Novembers, 2022
> Pan Ricemill No Bid Submitted
67 1,195,631.40 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. 1,125,000.00 1 Eastern Grain Center, Inc. ] _October13,2022 | October25,2022  November2, 2022 November 8, 2022
Pan Ricemill No Bid Submitted
68 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
69 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
70 1,195631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
71 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing NoBid Submitted
72 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
73 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
74 1,195,631.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill 939,831.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill
75 1,195,631.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill 939,831.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill
76 1,195,631.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill 939,831.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill
77 1,195,631.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill 939,831.40 EV dela Cruz Ricemill
78 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center October 13,2022 October 25,2022 November 2, 2022 November§, 2022
79 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
80 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,039,768.05 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
81 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Gralns Processing Center 1,041,624.35 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center
Pan Ricemill No Bid Submitted
az 1,195,631.40 Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center 1,041,624.35 ] Lucky Archer Grains Processing Center I October13,2022 | October25,2022 | Novenmbe?2,2022 | Novenmbe§, 2022
Pan Ricemill No Bld Submitted
83 119563140  |—LuclyArcher Grains Processing Center d‘:{:‘éﬁf_‘:ﬁ:ﬁg;‘c‘e‘:‘m‘f"“‘" ::2;—'———: 102 } Lucky Archer Grains Processing Genter October13,2022 | October25,2022 | November2,2022 | Novembers, 2022
84 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
85 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
86 1,195631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
87 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing NoBid Submitted
88 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill 8 Marketing
89 1,195,631.40 Goldrich Ricemill & Marketing
90 1,195,631.40 Atheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc.
91 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. 1,195,631.40 Alheed Intl. Agro Industries Inc.
92 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int', Agro Industrles Inc. 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. October13,2022 | Octaber25,2022 | November2,2022 |  November§,2022
93 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'). Agro Industries Inc.
01 1.195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
P dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemll 1,195,631.40 | dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill October 13,2022 | October 25,2022 | November 2,2022 November 8, 2022
o5 1.195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
e dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill 1,195,631.40 | dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill | October13,2022 | October 25,2022 | November 2, 2022 [ November 8, 2022
96 1,.195,631.40 Atheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
Mttt dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill 1,195,631.40 | dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill October13,2022 | October25,2022 | November2,2022 | Novembers, 2022
97 1,195,631.40 Alheed Int'l. Agro Industries Inc. Submitted Letter of Withdrawal
! dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill 1,195,631.40 dela Cruz-Cadelina Ricemill
98 1,195,631.40 RS Grains Ricemill 965,961.26 RS Grains Ricemill
29 1‘19—'—5 63140 RS Grains Ricemill 96—-'—5 96126 RS Grains Ricemill October 13, 2022 October 25, 2022 November 2, 2022 November 8, 2022
100 1,195,631.40 RS Grains Ricemill 965,961.26 RS Grafns Ricemill
101 1,195,631.40 RS Grains Ricemill 1 i a '
102 1,195,631.40 RS Grains Ricemill Letter of With
1:: ﬂg—-‘———g :gi:ig mg }g—'—g ggiﬁ : miﬁg : October13,2022 | October25,2022 | November2,2022 | Novembers, 2022
105 1,195,631.40 KNC Ricemill
106 1,195,631.40 KNC Ricemill
107 11 9——5 63140 KNC Ricemill Disquallfied due to insufficient documents submitted
108 1,195,631.40 KNC Ricemill




109 1,195,631.40
110 1,195,631.40
111 1,195,631.40
112 1,195,631.40
113 1,195,631.40
114 1,195,631.40 No interested biddder
115 1,195,631.40
116 1,195,631.40
117 1,195,631.40
118 1,195,631.40
119 1,195,631.40
120 1,195,631.40 {GL Ricemtll 1,195,631.40 IGL Ricemill
121 1,195,631.40 {GL Ricemill 1,195,631.40 IGL Ricemfli
122 1,195,631.40 JGL Ricemill 1,195,631.40 JGL Ricemill
123 1,195,631.40 I1GL Ricemill 1,195,631.40 ]GL Ricemill
124 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial
125 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial
126 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial
127 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commercial 1,195,631.40 Masagana Commerctal
128 1,195,63140 RC Lubong Ricemilt 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemill October13, 2022 October 25,2022 November 2, 2022 November 8, 2022
129 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemill 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemill
130 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemill 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemill
131 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemil 1,195,631.40 RC Lubong Ricemtll
132 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill
133 1,195631.40 Krisan Ricemill 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemiil
134 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill
135 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill 1,195,631.40 Krisan Ricemill
136 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Gralns Center & Ricemill 1,195,631.40 HR Pascua Grains Center & Ricemill
SUPPLY & DELWER;‘;;':O UNITS MOISTURE 1 1,000,000.00 Aspen Multl_System Corporation 998,004.00 Aspen Multl_System Corporation October 17,2022 - October 24, 2022 October 28, 2022
Prepared by: Certified correct: Noted:
i,
DIANNE APRI)S. PANGAN JULIUS B, S GUB

Member, BAC Secretarfat

Asst. Reglonal Manafer / BAC Chairperson

eglonal Manager Il HoPE




